
​ Dennis Greany <dennis@safetracsolutions.com>
​ To:
​ Louis Caissey
​ ,
​ Mark Pieloch
​ ,
​ Mark Belew
​ ,
​ r_kollars@yahoo.com
​ ,
​ ROY MCFARLANE
​ and 3 more...

​ Wed, Apr 20 at 12:02 PM
​ Hi Louie,
​
​ This invoice is not from the attorney that represented Mark Pieloch, Richard Kollars and myself.

This invoice is from Mr Belew’s attorney. Mr Belew filed a claim against the LOC, claiming the
LOC is responsible to represent him in the suit that was brought against him by myself, Mark &
Richard, since his actions (he claims) were covered as a member of the board.

​
​ If you need an explanation as to why the LOC is being charged for this, you need to speak to Mr

Belew. He is the the one that initiated the action.
​
​ Thank You!!
​
​ Dennis
​
​ Show original message
​
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